From: Patrick Stoica hipatark@gmail.com &
Subject: Re: Anthem
Date: August 23, 2024 at 3:12PM
To: Brianna Gutierrez hrpals@puzzle.io

Thank you, Brianna. I'll forward this.
This is my last contact. | don't mean to burden you personally.

Whether I've misinterpreted any events or caught everyone in a lie is not the point. I've suffered before, during, and after Puzzle. I've worked
with many people in my life and have never met such shameless people who can't own up to their mistakes in life. People who can't treat
me with an ounce of dignity without brushing aside the very real things I've found and questioned. People who have no idea how to de-
escalate a situation if it means they have to look inward for once in their lives. Refusing to acknowledge a single word while shuffling behind
the scenes, setting up meetings without talking to me directly, stalking me, and trying to shut me up with money... It was ultimately a failure
of their collective character and the exact type of brainwashing that is destroying the world every second. Their "emotional distress" is a
mere fraction of what I've gone through.

Everyone failed me. That's their karma to deal with. I'm not making threats. I'm not a violent person. I'm moving on as of today. This wound
has festered long enough.

Take care,
Patrick

On Fri, Aug 23, 2024 at 2:56 PM Brianna Gutierrez <hrpals @puzzle.io> wrote:
Patrick -

I confirmed with Cal Choice that your coverage is terminated. There was an issue in Anthem's system reloading your eligibility which
likely caused UHC to think you were covered by Anthem. Anthem confirmed that your benefits ended as of May 31, 2023. | have attached
the letter confirming your cancellation of coverage. You can provide this to UHC and this should serve as proof that you were not enrolled
in Anthem after May 31, 2023.

Best,

Brianna Gutierrez
HR Generalist

E: HRpals@puzzle.io
W: www.Puzzle.io

=) Puzzle

On Thu, Aug 22, 2024 at 7:29 AM Patrick Stoica <hipatark @gmail.com> wrote:
Local Tech Worker has to go through a billion insurance hoops for seeking therapy after being traumatized by previous employer (who
refuses contact at every step but is happy to shit on me and everything | did for them) and being unemployed and unknowingly
insured(???) for 9 months.

Coordination of Benefits

Summarize this conversation

‘ Client Services Humantold M...

To:

Hi Patrick,

We hope this email finds you well. It has come
to our attention that UHC is now reversing
payments they previously sent to us, claiming
they need more information from you and
stating that you still have insurance with Blue
all the number on
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the back of your UHC card to resolve this
matter. At present, there is an outstanding
patient balance of $2070 on the account due
to UHC reclaiming payments. Please update us
on the outcome, and if you wish to set up a 3-
way call with us, simply Let us know. We are
looking forward to hearing from you soon.

Best,
Client Services Department
Humantold Management

-+

On Thursday, Aug 08, 2024 at 7:16 PM, Patrick Stoica <hipatark@gmail.com> wrote:
If 1 was "laid off," | never even filed for unemployment. I'm beyond pissed off at you all.

On Thursday, Aug 08, 2024 at 7:15 PM, Patrick Stoica <hipatark@gmail.com> wrote:
I'm writing to inform you that Puzzle has thrown a wrench in my insurance situation that is out of
alignment with anything that was communicated around my "departure."

Anthem says | was laid off and have continued receiving insurance as an employer benefit.
Execs told my coworkers | voluntarily resigned, made everyone think I'm crazy, and | never even
used this insurance again because none of you ever communicated with me outside of sending
me a cease and desist letter.

You already revoked my equity and caused me endless damage to my mental health. Giving me
insurance to wipe your hands clean of everything is psychotic. Stop playing with people. | once
again wish | never joined Puzzle. Don't do this with people.

Patrick
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